



Bid Tabulation- BKFC - 1.0 Ton - 09022021 A

Bidder	Jeff Wyler Chrysler	Bidder	Gille Hyde Ford
Spec Truck Base Bid	\$ 48,130.00	Spec Truck Base Bid	\$ 46,652.00
Options		Options	
1	\$ 7,995.00	1	\$ 7,995.00
2	\$ 7,813.00	2	\$ 7,813.00
3A	\$ 12,100.00	3A	\$ 12,100.00
3B-Reduction	\$ -	3B-Reduction	\$ (530.00)
4	\$ 13,240.00	4	\$ 13,240.00
5	\$ 1,080.00	5	\$ 1,080.00
6	\$ 2,530.00	6	\$ 2,530.00
7	\$ 2,530.00	7	\$ 2,530.00
8A	\$ 10,544.00	8A	\$ 10,532.00
8B-Reduction	\$ -	8B-Reduction	\$ (530.00)
9-White	\$ -	9-White	\$ -
9-Red	\$ 575.00	9-Red	\$ 575.00
10	\$ 10,207.00	10	\$ 10,207.00
11	No Bid	11	No Bid
12	\$ 1,725.00	12	\$ 1,725.00
13	\$ 50,290.00	13	\$ 50,314.00
14	\$ 50,115.00	14	\$ 50,133.00
15	No Bid	15	\$ 49,611.00
16	No Bid	16	\$ 49,437.00
17	\$ 42,051.00	17	\$ 42,442.00
18	\$ 41,841.00	18	\$ 42,269.00
19	No Bid	19	\$ 41,685.00
20	No Bid	20	\$ 41,520.00
21	\$ 39,476.00	21	\$ 38,726.00
22	\$ 3,475.00	22	\$ 3,475.00
23	\$ 3,475.00	23	\$ 3,475.00
24	\$ 3,475.00	24	\$ 3,475.00
25	\$ 600.00	25	\$ 600.00
26	\$ 10,150.00	26	\$ 10,150.00
Delivery	230+ days from PO	Delivery	248 days from PO
Exceptions		Exceptions	
	230 day lead from order date is a projection due to material and production shortages according to Stellantis.		Ford Motor Company lead time is 32 weeks, as per Ford Production Bulletin #2134 dated 08/27/21.
	Page 6, Item 35 of ITB: No OEM all weather mats available with this trim level.		Page 6, Item 35: No OEM all weather mats available with this trim level.