



Bid Tabulation- BKFC - 2.5 Ton - 08052021 C

Bidder	Fyda Freightliner with WA Jones Pricing	Fyda Freightliner with Viking Upfit Pricing	Fyda Freightliner with Henderson Build Pricing	Worldwide Equipment Inc.
Cab & Chassis with spec. equip.	\$ 171,178.00	\$ 180,985.00	\$ 185,561.00	\$ 181,900.00
Options				
1	\$ 5,722.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,405.00	\$ 3,500.00
2	\$ 1,155.00	\$ 1,142.00	No Bid	\$ 1,142.00
3	\$ 506.00	\$ 425.00	No Bid	\$ 425.00
4	\$ 548.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 694.00	\$ 850.00
5 -Cost	\$ 5,368.00	\$ 770.00	\$ 4,414.00	\$ 7,700.00
5 -Reduction	\$ (13,307.00)	\$ (9,800.00)	\$ (14,002.00)	\$ (9,800.00)
6	No Bid	\$ 3,170.00	\$ 2,659.00	\$ 3,170.00
7-A	\$ 9,350.00	No Bid	\$ 4,972.00	No Bid
7-B	\$ 5,147.00	\$ 3,690.00	\$ 3,143.00	\$ 3,690.00
8	\$ 935.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,235.00	\$ 1,500.00
9	\$ 1,467.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,895.00	\$ 1,400.00
10	\$ 450.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 105.00
11-A1	No charge for non metallic	No charge for non metallic	No charge for non metallic	No charge
11-A2	No charge for non metallic	No charge for non metallic	No charge for non metallic	No charge
11-B1	No charge	No Charge	Included in base bid	No charge
11-B2	\$ 1,395.00	No Charge	Included in base bid	No charge
12	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 97.00
13	\$ 142.00	\$ 142.00	\$ 142.00	\$ 269.00
14	\$ 102.00	\$ 102.00	\$ 102.00	\$ 370.00
15	\$ 303.00	Included in base bid	Included in base bid	No charge
16	\$ 232.00	\$ 222.00	\$ 248.00	\$ 375.00
17	\$ (3,155.00)	\$ (2,600.00)	\$ (3,506.00)	\$ 2,600.00
18-A	\$ 20,447.00	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 21,276.00	\$ 14,749.00
18-B-Black	\$ 13,545.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 11,652.00	\$ 11,259.00
18-B-Red	\$ 15,638.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 11,652.00	\$ 11,259.00
18-C	\$ 12,398.00	\$ 10,825.00	\$ 10,984.00	\$ 3,125.00
19	\$ 7,850.00	\$ 9,040.00	\$ 13,460.00	\$ 9,040.00
Delivery	180-240 days from PO	180-240 days from PO	180-260 days from PO	May 2022 earliest and based on raw materials availability
Exceptions				
1	Page 11 Plow and frame- Item 2C-C shaped moldboard on plow in lieu of J shape	1 Corten A606-4 Body construction instead of mild steel line 29 meets the strength of grade 50 material and corrosion resistant	Page 13 - Dump bed and hydraulic system warranty is for 1 year not 2 years.	1 DEF to be a minimum of 6 gallons - this spec has 5.5 gallons
2	Page 3 equipment pricing-cannot be held for one full year. Fyda Freightliner Western Star will require flexibility to work with the vendor should the need arise to negotiate a price increase due to market conditions.	2 Two bumper wings (right and left side) provided as integral portion of plow hitch instead of line 4 OEM bumpers reinstalled with modifications and bracing	Page 3 - equipment pricing cannot be held for 1 full year due to the need for negotiations with the vendor because of market conditions	2 Tires rated for 70 MPH or greater - this spec has front tires at 68 MPH
3	Page 4 Time Period - 100% completed truck will not be completed within 180 days. Every effort will be made to deliver within 180 days. But many factors dictate delivery days.	3 Dual bullet camera mounted in rear corner post of body allows for both rear lights to be visible from any angle without tailgate obstruction. Also allows for integration of bullet camera to corner post for protection.	Page 4 Time period - 100% completed truck will not be completed within 180 days. Every effort will be made for delivery in 180 days but many factors will dictate delivery days.	3 Wing style dashboard - not available
4	Page 9 - Truck will be provided fuses in lieu of breakers.	4 Page 13 - dump bed and hydraulic system warranty is for 1 year not 2 years	Page 9 - Truck will be provided fuses in lieu of breakers.	4 Heated windshield - not available, please note Kenworth cab HVAC system is efficient enough.
5	Page 9 - LED headlights are available but not in bid pricing. Option pricing is listed under additional options section.	5 Page 3 - equipment pricing cannot be held for 1 full year due to the need for negotiations with the vendor because of market conditions	Page 9 - LED headlights are available but not in bid pricing. Option pricing is listed under additional options section.	5 Delivery time period - due to the nature of vast raw materials shortages a 180 day delivery cannot be guaranteed at this time. Kenworth's current production lead time for the T480 model is May of 2022. This is subject to change based on raw materials availability.
6	Page 11 Depending on hitch chosen, hood may or may not open 90 degrees.	6 Page 6 - No bid 7A - 7B galvanized steel not steel	Page 11 - Depending on hitch chosen, hood may or may not open 90 degrees.	6 Line 29 - Corten A606-4 is supplied not mild steel - grade 50 material strength met and corrosion resist.
7	Page 13 Diagnostic software is not included in bid pricing. Purchase pricing for yearly subscription is available in the options section.	7 Page 4 Time period - 100% completed truck will not be completed within 180 days. Every effort will be made for delivery in 180 days but many factors will dictate delivery days.	Page 13 - Diagnostic software is not included in bid pricing. Purchase pricing for yearly subscription is available in the options section.	7 Line 4 - 2 bumper wings (right & left side) instead of OEM bumpers reinstalled - see exceptions sheet
		8 Page 9 - Truck will be provided fuses in lieu of breakers.		8 Dual bullet camera mounted in rear corner post of body. See exceptions sheet.
		9 Page 9 - LED headlights are available but not in bid pricing. Option pricing is listed under additional options section.		
		10 Page 11 - Depending on hitch chosen, hood may or may not open 90 degrees.		
		11 Page 13 - Diagnostic software is not included in bid pricing. Purchase pricing for yearly subscription is available in the options section.		

each